5 yr Bid Sheet

EZ Disposal &
Recycling Russell Disposal Capitol Waste Waste Management
Service Contract Sections Description FY15 5-yr Total FY15 5-yr Total FY15 5-yr Total FY15 5-yr Total
SOLID WASTE - FIVE DAY PER WEEK COLLECTION
Manual collection (continuing the status quo) for Solid |1-C, 2-A, 2-C, 2-F, 2-G, 3-A, 3-C, 3- Cost per year
5 [Waste E(a), 3-F through 3-T, Article 4 $ 1,638,381.00| $ 8,526,201.00 1,879,000.00 | $ 9,876,575.00 | $ 1,974,972.00 | $ 10,277,833.00 | $ 1,911,564.00 | $ 10,148,752.89
8 | Automated collection using a 64 gallon container with 1-C, 2-A, 2B, 2:C, 2-H, 2-1, 3-A, 3-
3 cential A B, 3-C, 3-E(a), 3-F through T, Cost per year
¢ |potential for overtlow program Article 4 $ 1,437,565.00 | $ 7,481,146.00 1,609,900.00 | $ 8,462,000.00 | $ 1,572,652.00 | $ 8,184,143.00 | $ 1,819,284.00 | $ 9,658,825.83
[%]
©
-gc SOLID WASTE - ONE DAY PER WEEK COLLECTION
S 1-C, 2-A, 2-C, 2-F, 2-G, 3-A, 3-C, 3-
¥ |Manual collection for Solid Waste A Cost per year
o E(a), 3-F through 3-T, Article 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
£ |Automated collection using a 64 gallon container with 1-C 2A, 28, 2:C, 2-H, 24, 3-A, 3
- tential f 1 B, 3-C, 3-E(a), 3-F through T, Cost per year
potentiat for overtiow program Article 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
RECYCLING - FIVE DAY PER WEEK (BIWEEKLY) COLLECTION
Manual collection (continuing the status quo) for 1-C, 2-A, 2-D, 3-A, 3-C, 3-E(b), 3-F Cost per year
Recycling through 3-T, Article 4 $ 795,139.00 | $ 4,137,936.00 882,760.00 | $ 4,639,650.00 | $ 786,137.00 | $ 3,511,726.00 | $ 785,519.00 | $ 4,170,427.05
1-C, 2-A, 2-B, 2-C, 2-H, 2-D, 3-A, 3
Automated collection using a 96 gallon container B, 3-C, 3-E(b), 3-F through T, Cost per year
Article 4 $ 925,000.00 | $ 4,813,737.00 944,600.00 | $ 4,965,100.00 | $ 968,727.00 | $ 5,041,295.00 | $ 1,454,105.61 | $ 6,859,159.25
oo
.£ |RECYCLING - ONE DAY PER WEEK (BIWEEKLY) COLLECTION
o
& . . 1-C, 2-A, 2-D, 3-A, 3-C, 3-E(b), 3-F
@ [Manual collection for Recycling. : Cost per year ) . . . . . . .
@ Ve yeung through 3-T, Article 4 pery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
__: I-C, =R, Z°D, Z-C, Z-T1, Z-U, 5°R, 5
o i i iner. B, 3-C, 3-E(b), 3-F th hT, Cost . . . . . . . .
g Automated collection using a 96 gallon container. E\ 1 - roug ost per year No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
-]
c
g RECYCLING - FIVE DAY PER WEEK (WEEKLY) COLLECTION
§ Manual collection for Recyclin 1-C, 2-A, 2°D, 3-A, 3-C, 3-E(b), 3-F Cost per year
E yelng through 3-T, Article 4 Pery $ 1,306,773.00| $ 6,800,499.00 No Bid No Bid 3 1,434,463.00 | $ 7,465,001.00 No Bid No Bid
: 1-C, 2-A, 2-B, 2-C, 2-H, 2-D, 3-A, 3
S |Automated collection using a 64 gallon container B, 3-C, 3-E(b), 3-F through T, Cost per year
w .
[S Article 4 S 1,540,885.00 | $ 8,018,827.00 No Bid No Bid S 1,616,652.00 | $ 7,050,329.00 No Bid No Bid
RECYCLING - ONE DAY PER WEEK (WEEKLY) COLLECTION
. . 1-C, 2-A, 2-D, 3-A, 3-C, 3-E(b), 3-F
Manual collection for Recycling. : Cost per year ) . . . . . . .
Y yeung through 3-T, Article 4 pery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1-C, 2-A, 2-B, 2-C, 2-H, 2-D, 3-A, 3
Automated collection using a 64 gallon container B, 3-C, 3-E(b), 3-F through T, Cost per year
Article 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
OVERFLOW PROGRAM OPTION
9 o
= ‘g E‘JAdditional Cart Rentals 2-1 Cost per year/cart
= 3 o) S 75.00 $ 75.00 $ 75.00
e LEAVES AND GRASS COLLECTION
‘E' «» @Four (4) city-wide leaves and grass collection days 2-E Cost per year S 50,000.00 | $ 260,202.00 80,000.00 | $ 420,260.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 260,202.00 | $ 62,400.00 | $ 331,290.07
i % |Additional Days 2-E Cost per day S 12,500.00 | $ 65,050.00 22,000.00 | $ 115,684.00 | $ 12,500.00 | $ 65,050.00 | $ 15,600.00 | $ 82,821.00
— @
—
w g REBATE ON RECYCLABLE MATERIAL
E % Zero(0) Floor 3-S Rebate per ton None None None None None None None None
Ex
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S > o BULKY WASTE CURBSIDE COLLECTION
E i:‘, §Attach proposal and/or price sheet for bulky waste items. 2-F Cost Per year
|: [+
|Alternative Proposals by Vendor
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